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Product Overview

Virocheq is a scientifically formulated antiviral 
supplement designed to enhance immunity, combat viral 
infections, and promote overall poultry health. With a 
powerful blend of natural bioactive ingredients, 
Virocheq supports immune function, reduces oxidative 
stress, and provides broad-spectrum antiviral protection. 
Its unique combination of phytoextracts and essential 
nutrients aids in faster recovery from infections and 
strengthens disease resistance.

Composition (Each 100 ml contains)

Ingredient Quantity (Per 100 ml)

Nucleotide 500 mg

Zinc sulphate 300 mg

L-Lysine 100 mg

Folic acid 65 mg

Andrographis paniculata 12000 mg

Hypericum perforatum 12000 mg

Azadirachta indica 10000 mg

Ocimum sanctum 9000 mg

Thymus vulgaris 9000 mg

Tinospora cordifolia 8000 mg

Asparagus racemosus 6000 mg

Zingiber officinale 3000 mg

Eucalyptus globules 3000 mg

Cinnamonum camphora 600 mg

Thyme Oil 10000 mg

Mint Oil 10000 mg

Mode of Action

Virocheq works through a synergistic combination of 
herbal extracts, essential nutrients, and immune-
boosting compounds:

•Antiviral & Immune Modulation

Andrographis paniculata, Hypericum perforatum, and 
Tinospora cordifolia exhibit strong antiviral properties, 
helping to combat viral infections.

•Respiratory & Gut Health

Ocimum sanctum, Thymus vulgaris, and Zingiber 
officinale help soothe respiratory distress, enhance 
digestion, and promote gut health.

•Antioxidant & Anti-inflammatory Support

Azadirachta indica, Asparagus racemosus, and 
Cinnamonum camphora reduce oxidative stress and 
inflammation.

•Essential Oils for Protection

Thyme oil and Mint oil provide additional antimicrobial 
and immune-boosting effects.

Advantages of Virocheq

•Broad-Spectrum Antiviral Action – Potent herbal 
extracts help combat viral infections effectively.

•Enhances Immune Function – Boosts natural 
immunity, reducing susceptibility to diseases.

•Improves Respiratory & Gut Health – Supports lung 
function and improves digestion.

•Reduces Oxidative Stress – Neutralizes free radicals, 
minimizing cellular damage.

•Safe & Natural Formulation – No synthetic chemicals 
or harmful residues, making it safe for poultry.

Why Choose Virocheq?

Virocheq provides powerful antiviral protection with a 
blend of natural extracts and essential nutrients that 
boost immune function and combat viral infections. Its 
herbal composition ensures safe and effective support for 
overall animal health and vitality. Choose Virocheq for 
enhanced immunity, growth, and disease resistance.

Presentation

Available in 1 L HDPE bottle
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